ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE
VILLAGE OF NORTH RIVERSIDE MUNICIPAL CODE
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

BE IT ORDAINED by President and Board of Trustees of the Village of
North Riverside, Cook County, Illinois, as follows:
SECTION 1. The Village of North Riverside hereby adopts the 2006
International Mechanical Code in its entirety as a new Section 15.58 to Title 15
of the Village of North Riverside Municipal Code.
Section 15.58‘

(A) Code Adopted: The International Mechanical Code, 2006 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the village clerk, is hereby adopted as the mechanical code of the Village of North
Riverside for regulating and controlling the design, construction, quality of materials,
erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to,
use ot maintenance of mechanical systems in the village; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said international
mechanical code are incorporated by reference as though fully set forth herein.

(B) Amendments: For purposes of this code, the International Mechanical Code, 2006
edition, as incorporated herein, is hereby amended in the following respects:

Section 101.1 Title: These regulations shall be known as the mechanical code of the
Village of North Riverside, llinois, hereinafter referred to as "the mechanical code.”
All references herein to "this code" shall refer to the mechanical code.

Section 101.5 References To International Plumbing Code: Any and all references
in the mechanical code to the "international plumbing code” shall be deleted and
replaced by the "/llinois plumbing code, 77 Ill. adm. code 8§90.110 et seq."

Section 106.5 Fees, Deleted in its entirety.

Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule. Deleted in its entirety.

Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds. Deleted in its entirety.




Section 108.4 Violation Penalties: Any person, corporation, partnership, company or
other entity who or which violates any provisions of this Code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be subject to a fine of not less than $25.00 nor more than $750.00 or
imprisonment for a term not to exceed six months, or both. A separate offense shall
be deemed committed on each day during or on which a violation occurs or

continues.

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders: Upon notice from the code official that
mechanical work is being done contrary to the provisions of this code orin a
dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be
in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner's agent, or
to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work
is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be
required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall
continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable for a fine of not less than $100.00 or more than $750.00.

Section 109 Means Of Appeal: Section 109 is deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 2. REPEALER. Al ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict

with any of the provisions of this Ordinance shall be, and the same are hereby repealed.

SECTION 3. SEVERABILITY. This Ordinance, and every provision thereof,

shall be considered severable. In the event that any court of competent jurisdiction may
find and declare any word, phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, provision or section or
part of a phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, provisions or section of this Ordinance is
void or unconstitutional, the remaining words, phrases, clauses, sentences, paragraphs,
and provisions and parts of phrases, clauses, sentences, paragraphs, provisions and

sections not ruled void or unconstitutional shall continue in full force and effect.



SECTION 4. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in full force and

effect from and after its passage, approval and publication in pamphlet form as provided

by law.

AYES:
NAYS:

ABSENT:

Kenneth Krochmal,
Village President
PASSED:
APPROVED:
PUBLISHED:

ATTEST:

Dr. Queenella Miller
Village Clerk




